

City of Bucyrus, Raw Water Line Conversion, Sludge Lagoon Abandonment, Old WTP Demolition, 1C

Item No.	Jones & Henry Engineers, Ltd. Addenda: 1 Bids Received: 03/27/18			Allen Excavating 7155 East County Road 6 Bloomville, Ohio 44818 419-261-7854		B&B Wrecking & Excavating, Inc. 4510 East 71st Street, Ste 6 Cleveland, Ohio 44105 216-429-1700		Burch Hydro 17860 Ankneytown Frederick, Ohio 43019 740-694-9146	
	Description	Quantity	Unit	Unit Pr.	Amount	Unit Pr.	Amount	Unit Pr.	Amount
1	Raw Water Line Conversion only	1	LS		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
1a	24-inch Butterfly Valve only	1	Ea.		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
2	Sludge Lagoon Abandonment only	1	LS		No Bid		No Bid		\$1,971,500.00
3	Old WTP Demolition only	1	LS		\$147,000.00		\$879,300.00		No Bid
Combined Bids Received									
1 + 1a + 3		1	LS		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
1 + 1a + 2 + 3		1	LS		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid

Item No.	Jones & Henry Engineers, Ltd. Addenda: 1 Bids Received: 03/27/18			Great Lakes Demolition Co. 1787 N. St. Rt. 510 Vickery, Ohio 43465 419-547-1901		Ours Excavating, Ltd. 4651 County Road 101 Mount Gilead, Ohio 43338 740-816-3660	
	Description	Quantity	Unit	Unit Pr.	Amount	Unit Pr.	Amount
1	Raw Water Line Conversion only	1	LS		\$166,500.00		\$275,000.00
1a	24-inch Butterfly Valve only	1	Ea.		\$19,900.00		\$6,900.00
2	Sludge Lagoon Abandonment only	1	LS		\$754,000.00		No Bid
3	Old WTP Demolition only	1	LS		\$332,500.00		\$285,000.00
Combined Bids Received							
1, 1a, & 3		1	LS		\$513,900.00		\$535,000.00
1 + 1a + 2 + 3		1	LS		\$1,172,900.00		No Bid

Low Bid Evaluation				
Single Item	Description	Quantity	Unit	Amount
1 + 1a	Great Lakes Demolition Co.	166,500 + 19,900		\$186,400.00
2	Great Lakes Demolition Co.	1	LS	\$754,000.00
3	Allen Excavating	1	LS	\$147,000.00
Total		1		\$1,087,400.00

Combination Bids				
Item	Description	Quantity	Unit	Amount
1 + 1a + 3	Great Lakes Demolition Co.	1	LS	\$513,900.00
Item 2	Great Lakes Demolition Co.	1	LS	\$754,000.00
Total				\$1,267,900.00

1 + 1a + 2 + 3	Great Lakes Demolition Co.	1	LS	\$1,172,900.00
Total				\$1,172,900.00